
Alexandria Va Sept 1st/63 
Dear Ann and Children 

again I seat myself to talk with you I received yours last evening on my return 
from the 2nd Corps 1st Division and 2nd Brigade they are near Kelley's ford on the 
Rapahanock I had been out there in command of drafted men we are here on that 
kind of duty now guarding them to their Regiments we go on the cars to the nearest 
Station with a guard detailed from our Brigade and after delivering them return on the 
cars it takes about two days for a trip I have been twice since we came here last 
tuesday and like it well I went on Sunday and that night staid in the 64th with Capt 
Hunt and Capt Wait and Chaplain Hibbard but slept in the Chaplains tent, we had a 
good visit, they sent their respects to you when I got back yesterday found Wm Henry 
here and I tell you I was glad to see him he is fat as a pig and feels well, to day I have 
been up to the paroll camp with Lieut Chapman who also came yesterday and have 
seen most of the parolled prisoners of our Regt had a real good visit it seemed like 
meeting friends at home after being so long away from them as we had stood side by 
side on the field where death was dealing destruction broadcast around and I had to 
describe the seenes of Gettysburg for them. I am still in the Regt and if we stay here 
where there is not much marching to do I mean to stay in it but am satisfied that I 
cannot stand it to march as we have done nor shall I try it. we expect to be paid next 
week or at farthest week after and then I shall send you the money by Express, tell 
John he can sell the team for what they will fetch but I want the pay turned in on my 
debts for I am anxious to get out of debt as soon as I can. you asked me if you should 
knit me a pair of mitten I think not but knit me one or two pair of socks and I will write 
when I want them, as to the cheese making that you and Joe talked of you can count 
me in on that contract for if we have good luck and I get home safe and sound I intend 
to go there within six months after I come home for I am getting old fast and I do not 
calculate to work land on shares any more after I get out of the service now Dear I 
believe I have answered all of your questions as well as I could and I shall draw to a 
close. I just got the mail and got a letter from Libbie and little Joe with a little pin 
cussion from the Girls, tell Flore and Allie to write for I feel as though they are 
forgetting me when they do not write and now good night all and may God protect and 
care for us untill we meet is the prayr of your Aff 

Husband and Father 
S. W. Beardsley 

P S Willie sends his love and wants you and the children to write to him Write soon 
and give me all the news 

S. W. Beardsley 

To Ann E. Beardsley 
and his little Daughters 
Flora and Allie 
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